

COUNTY OF LEXINGTON

Procurement Services
212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503, 5th Floor
Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493



Phone (803) 785-8166
Fax (803) 785-2240

THIS IS A STATEMENT OF **INTENT TO AWARD** A CONTRACT AND BECOMES THE OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF AWARD CONTINGENT UPON COUNTY COUNCIL APPROVAL UNLESS OTHERWISE RESCINDED.

REFERENCE SOLICITATION NUMBER: 2015-IFB-10

PROCUREMENT: Landscape and Turf Erosion Supplies – Term Contract

ISSUE DATE: January 26, 2015

CLOSING DATE: February 26, 2015

AWARD(S) ARE MADE TO THE FOLLOWING:

**Delta Landscape Supply of Georgia Inc.
Estimated \$20,400.00**

		<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Est. Total Cost</u>
Item# P1.1	Annual Rye Grass	\$0.42	\$1,260.00
Item# P1.4	Brown-Top Millet	\$0.50	\$1,500.00
Item# P1.5	Mulch, Hydro Green, Standard	\$10.75	\$5,160.00
Item# P1.6	Mulch, Hydro, Red	\$14.00	\$5,040.00
Item# P1.9	Bahia Grass, Pensacola	\$1.24	\$7,440.00

**Pennington Seed Company Inc.
Estimated \$60,500.00**

		<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Est. Total Cost</u>
Item# P1.2	Bermuda, Hulled	\$3.35	\$20,100.00
Item# P1.3	Bermuda, Unhulled	\$2.50	\$15,000.00
Item# P1.7	Curlex 3 Revegetation Matting	\$40.00	\$20,000.00
Item# P1.8	Sediment Logs, 12” x 10”	\$16.00	\$3,200.00
Item# P1.10	Sod Staples, 6”	\$22.00	\$1,100.00
Item# P1.11	Sod Staples, 8”	\$22.00	\$1,100.00

An actual bidder who is aggrieved in connection with the intended award or award of a contract shall protest to the Procurement Manager in writing within ten (10) calendar days of the date of Intent to Award notice. Protest letter shall state the issues of the protest, specifically listing where the County failed in determining the potential award.

Kay Keisler
Procurement Officer

Posted: March 13, 2015

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER.

COUNTY OF LEXINGTON - LANDSCAPE AND TURF EROSION SUPPLIES-TERM CONTRACT - BID# 2015-IFB-10	BWI Companies, Inc.	John Deere Landscapes	Pennington Seed Co. Inc.	Delta Landscape Supply of Georgia Inc.
Total Bid	49,731.00	74,916.00	83,408.00	105,354.50
Subtotal: Required Items	49,731.00	74,916.00	83,408.00	105,354.50
Subtotal: Optional Items	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
Product Line Items	49,731.00	74,916.00	83,408.00	105,354.50
Group P1	49,731.00	74,916.00	83,408.00	105,354.50
P1.1 Annual Rye-Grass	1,401.00	1,695.00	1,500.00	1,260.00
Unit Cost	0.467	0.565	0.50	0.42
Annual Rye-Grass				
Quantity	3000	3000	3000	3000
Estimated Delivery Date	3/15/2015	3/6/2015	3/15/2015	3/1/2015
Comment (Optional)		20-02-850	as needed	50 lbs per bag
P1.2 Bermuda, Hulled	27,840.00	33,810.00	20,100.00	28,800.00
Unit Cost	4.64	5.635	3.35	4.80
Bermuda, Hulled				
Quantity	6000	6000	6000	6000
Estimated Delivery Date	3/15/2015	3/6/2015	3/15/2015	3/1/2015
Comment (Optional)		20-21-050	sahara hulled pk	50 lbs per bag
P1.3 Bermuda, Unhulled	18,960.00	27,108.00	15,000.00	20,880.00
Unit Cost	3.16	4.518	2.50	3.48
Bermuda, Unhulled				
Quantity	6000	6000	6000	6000
Estimated Delivery Date	3/15/2015	3/6/2015		3/1/2015
Comment (Optional)		20-21-053	sahara unhulled pk	50 lbs per bag
P1.4 Brown-Top Millet	1,530.00	2,295.00	1,800.00	1,500.00
Unit Cost	0.51	0.765	0.60	0.50
Brown-Top Millet				
Quantity	3000	3000	3000	3000
Estimated Delivery Date	3/15/2015	3/6/2015	3/15/2015	3/1/2015
Comment (Optional)		20-21-052	as needed	50 lbs per bag

COUNTY OF LEXINGTON - LANDSCAPE AND TURF EROSION SUPPLIES-TERM CONTRACT - BID# 2015-IFB-10	BWI Companies, Inc.	John Deere Landscapes	Pennington Seed Co. Inc.	Delta Landscape Supply of Georgia Inc.
P1.5 Mulch, Hydro Green, Standard	0.00	0.00	5,280.00	5,160.00
Unit Cost	0.00	0.00	11.00	10.75
Mulch, Hydro Green, Standard, Wood Fiber Only				
Quantity	480	480	480	480
Estimated Delivery Date			3/15/2015	3/1/2015
Comment (Optional)	no bid	No Bid	as needed	Pro wood 50 lbs per bale
P1.6 Mulch, Hydro, Red	0.00	0.00	5,328.00	5,040.00
Unit Cost	0.00	0.00	14.80	14.00
Mulch, Hydro, Red, Wood Fiber With Tackifier Only				
Quantity	360	360	360	360
Estimated Delivery Date			3/15/2015	3/1/2015
Comment (Optional)	no bid	No Bid	as needed	Eco Fiber 50 lbs per bale
P1.7 Curlex 3 Revegetation Matting	0.00	0.00	20,000.00	29,500.00
Unit Cost	0.00	0.00	40.00	59.00
Curlex 3 Revegetation Matting, Double-Sided (36 Months)				
Quantity	500	500	500	500
Estimated Delivery Date			3/30/2015	3/1/2015
Comment (Optional)	no bid	No Bid	8'x50' (44.4 sq. yds)	American Excel 8'x90'

COUNTY OF LEXINGTON - LANDSCAPE AND TURF EROSION SUPPLIES-TERM CONTRACT - BID# 2015-IFB-10	BWI Companies, Inc.	John Deere Landscapes	Pennington Seed Co. Inc.	Delta Landscape Supply of Georgia Inc.
P1.8 Sediment Logs, 12" x 10"	0.00	0.00	3,200.00	3,450.00
Unit Cost	0.00	0.00	16.00	17.25
Sediment Logs, 12" x 10" (Excelsior SD-3)				
Quantity	200	200	200	200
Estimated Delivery Date			3/15/2015	3/1/2015
Comment (Optional)	no bid	No Bid	as needed	Excelsior Wattles 12"x10'
P1.9 Bahia Grass, Pensacola	0.00	10,008.00	9,000.00	7,440.00
Unit Cost	0.00	1.668	1.50	1.24
Bahia Grass, Pensacola				
Quantity	6000	6000	6000	6000
Estimated Delivery Date			3/15/2015	3/1/2015
Comment (Optional)	no bid	20-21-530		50 lbs per bag
P1.10 Sod Staples, 6"	0.00	0.00	1,100.00	1,200.00
Unit Cost	0.00	0.00	22.00	24.00
Sod Staples, 6"				
Quantity	50	50	50	50
Estimated Delivery Date			3/15/2015	3/1/2015
Comment (Optional)	no bid	No Bid	as needed 1000 per box	1000 staples per box
P1.11 Sod Staples 8"	0.00	0.00	1,100.00	1,124.50
Unit Cost	0.00	0.00	22.00	22.49
Sod Staples 8"				
Quantity	50	50	50	50
Estimated Delivery Date			3/15/2015	3/1/2015
Comment (Optional)	no bid	No Bid	as needed 500 per box	500 staples per box