

COUNTY OF LEXINGTON

Procurement Services
212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503, 5th Floor
Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493



Phone (803) 785-8319
Fax (803) 785-2240

THIS IS A STATEMENT OF **INTENT TO AWARD** A CONTRACT AND BECOMES THE OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF AWARD CONTINGENT UPON COUNTY COUNCIL APPROVAL UNLESS OTHERWISE RESCINDED.

REFERENCE SOLICITATION NUMBER: **2017-IFB-09**

PROCUREMENT: **OFFICE SUPPLIES – TERM CONTRACT**

ISSUE DATE: **JUNE 28, 2016**

CLOSING DATE: **AUGUST 5, 2016**

AWARD IS MADE TO THE FOLLOWING:

Forms & Supply, Inc.
\$59,022.85

An actual bidder who is aggrieved in connection with the intended award or award of a contract shall protest to the Procurement Manager in writing within ten (10) calendar days of the date of Intent to Award notice. Protest letter shall state the issues of the protest, specifically listing where the County failed in determining the potential award.

Angela M. Seymour
Procurement Officer

Posted: ***August 16, 2016***

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER.

OFFICE SUPPLIES			
2017-IFB-09			
	Forms & Supply, Inc.	Alpha Business Essentials	School Specialty Inc
Total Bid (Group P1 + Group P2)	\$55,161.54	\$100,988.32	\$139,070.79
Tax	\$3,861.31	\$7,069.18	\$9,734.96
Grand Total	\$59,022.85	\$108,057.50	\$148,805.75
Group P1: SCHEDULE A	\$27,041.54	\$62,988.32	\$63,070.79
P1.1 Binder, 3 Ring 8 ½ x 11 1" Cap.			
Unit Price	\$0.99	\$1.50	\$1.06
Item Total Price	\$396.00	\$600.00	\$424.00
Description	Binder, 3 Ring 8 ½ x 11 1" Cap.	Binder, 3 Ring 8 ½ x 11 1" Cap.	Binder, 3 Ring 8 ½ x 11 1" Cap.
Quantity	400	400	400
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item# CRD90310	UNV20962	SSI# 1498380/ CARDINAL/ 90310-Black SSI# 1498381/ CARDINAL/90312-Blue SSI# 1498382/ CARDINAL/90313-Red SSI# 1498797/ CARDINAL/90318-White
P1.2 Binder, 3 Ring 8 ½ x 11 2" Cap.			
Unit Price	\$1.70	\$2.79	\$1.96
Item Total Price	\$306.00	\$502.20	\$352.80
Description	Binder, 3 Ring 8 ½ x 11 2" Cap.	Binder, 3 Ring 8 ½ x 11 2" Cap.	Binder, 3 Ring 8 ½ x 11 2" Cap.
Quantity	180	180	180
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item# CRD90330	UNV20982	SSI# 1498547/CARDINAL/90330-Black SSI# 1498548/CARDINAL/90332-Blue SSI# 1498549/CARDINAL/90333-Red SSI# 1498550/CARDINAL/90338-White

P1.3 Binder, 3 Ring 8 ½ x 11 3" Cap.			
Unit Price	\$3.09	\$3.99	\$3.34
Item Total Price	\$494.40	\$638.40	\$534.40
Description	Binder, 3 Ring 8 ½ x 11 3" Cap.	Binder, 3 Ring 8 ½ x 11 3" Cap.	Binder, 3 Ring 8 ½ x 11 3" Cap.
Quantity	160	160	160
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item# CRD90340	UNV20992	SSI# 1498551/CARDINAL/90340-Black SSI# 1498552/CARDINAL/90342-Blue SSI# 1498553/CARDINAL/90343-Red SSI# 1498554/CARDINAL/90348-White
P1.4 Box, Storage, FEL/00011			
Unit Price	\$6.69	\$108.87	\$25.37
Item Total Price	\$267.60	\$4,354.80	\$1,014.80
Catalog Number	FEL/00011	FEL/00011	FEL/00011
Description	Box, Storage, FEL/00011	Box, Storage, FEL/00011	Box, Storage, FEL/00011
Quantity	40	40	40
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # FEL00011. FSI sells OEM by 12/CT - must order in CT quantity. Alternate item option: BSN42050 at \$4.70 EA. Alternate also sold 12/CT and must be ordered in CT quantity. Stacking weight is 350lb.	FEL00011	SSI# 1327537/BANKERS BOX/0070503 Bid and sold as pack of 4
P1.5 Chair Mat, Secretary 45" x 53"			
Unit Price	\$28.20	\$49.98	\$62.27
Item Total Price	\$1,128.00	\$1,999.20	\$2,490.80
Description	Chair Mat, Secretary 45" x 53"	Chair Mat, Secretary 45" x 53"	Chair Mat, Secretary 45" x 53"
Quantity	40	40	40
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # DEFCM11232	UNV56807	SSI# 1137376/DEFLECT-O/CM24231

P1.6 Deflect-O DuraMat Glass Clear Chairmats 46 X 6			
Unit Price	\$60.96	\$112.18	\$0.00
Item Total Price	\$365.76	\$673.08	\$0.00
Description	DEF CM33443F	DEF CM33443F	DEF CM33443F
Quantity	6	6	6
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item# DEFCM33443F		NO BID
P1.7 Pen, Roller Ball, Fine Point, PILOT/V5, Black, Red & Blue, #35334			
Unit Price	\$11.70	\$19.48	\$12.96
Item Total Price	\$4,258.80	\$7,090.72	\$4,717.44
Catalog Number	#35334	#35334	#35334
Description	Pen, Roller Ball, Fine Point, PILOT/V5, Black, Red & Blue, #35334	Pen, Roller Ball, Fine Point, PILOT/V5, Black, Red & Blue, #35334	Pen, Roller Ball, Fine Point, PILOT/V5, Black, Red & Blue, #35334
Quantity	364	364	364
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item# PIL35334Alternate#1 is BICGREM11BK at \$6.90/DZ. Alternate #2 is ITA39390 at \$5.67/DZ.	PIL35334	SSI# 072321/PILOT/35334
P1.8 Pen, Rollerball, GRP, FN, BK			
Unit Price	\$6.20	\$10.54	\$6.37
Item Total Price	\$334.80	\$569.16	\$343.98
Description	BIC GRE11-BK	BIC GRE11-BK	BIC GRE11-BK
Quantity	54	54	54
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item# BICGRE11BK		SSI#077375/BIC USA INC/GRE11-BK
P1.9 Pen, Ball PT, Retractable, Med			
Unit Price	\$5.25	\$6.85	\$5.40
Item Total Price	\$504.00	\$657.60	\$518.40
Description	BIC SCSM11BK	BIC SCSM11BK	BIC SCSM11BK
Quantity	96	96	96
Estimated Delivery Date	8/5/2016	8/3/2016	8/17/2016
Comment (Optional)	FSI item# BICSCSM11BK		SSI#1398104/BIC USA INC/SCSM11-BK

P1.10 Pen, Rollerball, Precise, Blue			
Unit Price	\$11.70	\$15.10	\$12.96
Item Total Price	\$561.60	\$724.80	\$622.08
Description	PIL 35335	PIL 35335	PIL 35335
Quantity	48	48	48
Estimated Delivery Date	8/5/2016	8/3/2016	8/17/2016
Comment (Optional)	FSI item# PIL35335. Alternate#1 is BICGREM11BE at \$6.90/DZ. Alternate #2 is ITA39391 at \$5.67/DZ.		SSI#072329/PILOT CORP OF AMERICA/35349
P1.11 Pen, Rollerball, Precise, Red			
Unit Price	\$11.70	\$15.10	\$12.96
Item Total Price	\$292.50	\$377.50	\$324.00
Description	PIL 35336	PIL 35336	PIL 35336
Quantity	25	25	25
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item# PIL35336		SSI#072327/PILOT CORP OF AMERICA/35352
P1.12 Pen, Rollerball, Precise, BK			
Unit Price	\$11.70	\$15.10	\$12.96
Item Total Price	\$280.80	\$362.40	\$311.04
Description	PIL 35334	PIL 35334	PIL 35334
Quantity	24	24	24
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item# PIL35334Alternate#1 is BICGREM11BK at \$6.90/DZ. Alternate #2 is ITA39390 at \$5.67/DZ.		SSI#072326/PILOT CORP OF AMERICA/35346
P1.13 Pen, Jetstream, RT			
Unit Price	\$20.88	\$2.86	\$19.20
Item Total Price	\$501.12	\$68.64	\$460.80
Description	SAN 62153	SAN 62153	SAN 62153
Quantity	24	24	24
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item# SAN62153FSI sells by EA. Price per each is \$1.74.		SSI#089403/SANFORD LP/62152

P1.14 Pen, Ball Pt, RDSTIC, Med			
Unit Price	\$0.89	\$2.09	\$3.87
Item Total Price	\$178.00	\$418.00	\$774.00
Description	BIC GSM11-BK	BIC GSM11-BK	BIC GSM11-BK
Quantity	200	200	200
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # BICGSM11BK. Alternate item is BSN37501 at \$.80/DZ		SSI#1398107/BIC USA INC/SGSM11-BK
P1.15 Pen, Ball Pt, RDSTIC, Med			
Unit Price	\$0.89	\$1.86	\$3.87
Item Total Price	\$53.40	\$111.60	\$232.20
Description	BIGSM11-BL	BIGSM11-BL	BIGSM11-BL
Quantity	60	60	60
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item# BICGSM11BE. Alternate item is BSN37500 at \$.80/DZ	BICGSM11BE	SSI#1398108/BIC USA INC/SGSM11-BE
P1.16 Highlighter, Briteliner			
Unit Price	\$3.67	\$5.53	\$3.60
Item Total Price	\$264.24	\$398.16	\$259.20
Description	BIC BL11-BE	BIC BL11-BE	BIC BL11-BE
Quantity	72	72	72
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # BICBL11BE. Alternate item is ITA36184 at \$2.36/DZ		SSI#1329756/BIC USA INC/BL11-BE
P1.17 Highlighter, Pen, Yellow			
Unit Price	\$3.25	\$4.25	\$3.60
Item Total Price	\$195.00	\$255.00	\$216.00
Description	AVE 23591	AVE 23591	AVE 23591
Quantity	60	60	60
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # AVE23591. Alternate item is ITA36181 at \$2.36/DZ		SSI#077279/BIC USA INC/BL11-YW

P1.18 Marker, Permanent, Sharpie, FN			
Unit Price	\$4.08	\$9.25	\$7.47
Item Total Price	\$293.76	\$666.00	\$537.84
Description	SAN30001	SAN30001	SAN30001
Quantity	72	72	72
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # SAN30001. Alternate #1 is BICGPM11BK at \$3.90/DZ. Alternate #2 is ITA30016 at \$3.28/DZ		SSI#077399/SANFORD LP/30001
P1.19 Tape, Scotch, Invisible, ¾"Wide, #MMM6203/41296			
Unit Price	\$0.54	\$1.79	\$18.67
Item Total Price	\$762.48	\$2,527.48	\$26,362.04
Catalog Number	#MMM6203/41296	#MMM6203/41296	#MMM6203/41296
Description	Tape, Scotch, Invisible, ¾"Wide,#MMM6203/41296	Tape, Scotch, Invisible, ¾"Wide,#MMM6203/41296	Tape, Scotch, Invisible, ¾"Wide,#MMM6203/41296
Quantity	1412	1412	1412
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # MMM6200341296. Alternate item is BSN32952 at \$.52/RL	MMM 6200341296	SSI# 075483/SCOTCH/810P10K bid and sold as pack of 10
P1.20 Dispenswer, Tape, C38, Black			
Unit Price	\$2.55	\$3.54	\$2.35
Item Total Price	\$214.20	\$297.36	\$197.40
Description	MMM C38-BK	MMM C38-BK	MMM C38-BK
Quantity	84	84	84
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # MMMC38BK. Alternate item is BSN32954 at \$1.55/EA		SSI#023127/SCOTCH/C-38
P1.21 Compressed Air, Computer, Cleaning, 10 oz.			
Unit Price	\$3.70	\$9.22	\$6.65
Item Total Price	\$999.00	\$2,489.40	\$1,795.50
Description	Compressed Air, Computer, Cleaning, 10 oz.	Compressed Air, Computer, Cleaning, 10 oz.	Compressed Air, Computer, Cleaning, 10 oz.
Quantity	270	270	270
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item# FALDPSXL	END11384	SSI# 1498370/FALCON/DPSXL

P1.22 File Folder, Manila, Letter Size, 1/2 Cut			
Unit Price	\$5.46	\$16.88	\$6.67
Item Total Price	\$2,730.00	\$8,440.00	\$3,335.00
Description	File Folder, Manila, Letter Size, 1/2 Cut	File Folder, Manila, Letter Size, 1/2 Cut	File Folder, Manila, Letter Size, 1/2 Cut
Quantity	500	500	500
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item# PFX75212	UNV12112	SSI# 015738/SCHOOL SMART/1102 Bid and priced as pack of 100
P1.23 Divider, Leather, Tabs			
Unit Price	\$1.74	\$4.98	\$0.00
Item Total Price	\$187.92	\$537.84	\$0.00
Description	AVE 11350	AVE 11350	AVE 11350
Quantity	108	108	108
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # AVE11350		NO BID
P1.24 Pad, Letter Size, White, 8 ½" X 11", 12 Pads/Pack			
Unit Price	\$6.34	\$10.38	\$5.12
Item Total Price	\$507.20	\$830.40	\$409.60
Description	Pad, Letter Size, White, 8 ½" X 11", 12 Pads/Pack	Pad, Letter Size, White, 8 ½" X 11", 12 Pads/Pack	Pad, Letter Size, White, 8 ½" X 11", 12 Pads/Pack
Quantity	80	80	80
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # APDLTRPADWE	UNV20630	SSI# 027433/SCHOOL SMART/027433
P1.25 Pad, 5 X 8, Canary			
Unit Price	\$4.65	\$8.50	\$2.57
Item Total Price	\$390.60	\$714.00	\$215.88
Quantity	84	84	84
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item# APDJRLEGALCY	UNV46200	SSI#027439/TOPS/027439

P1.26 PAD,PERF,LGL RLD,LTR,CA			
Unit Price	\$20.15	\$28.99	\$7.95
Item Total Price	\$1,209.00	\$1,739.40	\$477.00
Description	AMP20020	AMP20020	AMP20020
Quantity	60	60	60
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # TOP20020. If OEM chosen FSI will bring item into stock allowing next day delivery. Alternate item is APDLTRPADCY at \$6.34/DZ	TOP20020	SSI#027427/TOPS/027427
P1.27 Post It Note Pad 3" x 5"			
Unit Price	\$3.85	\$16.18	\$14.39
Item Total Price	\$446.60	\$1,876.88	\$1,669.24
Description	Post It Note Pad 3" x 5"	Post It Note Pad 3" x 5"	Post It Note Pad 3" x 5"
Quantity	116	116	116
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item# BSN36613	UNV35672	SSI# 028640/3M/655
P1.28 Post It Note 1.5" X 2" Yellow			
Unit Price	\$1.19	\$6.02	\$4.64
Item Total Price	\$228.48	\$1,155.84	\$890.88
Description	BSW 36610	BSW 36610	BSW 36610
Quantity	192	192	192
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item# BSN36610	MMM653YW	SSI#040548/3M/653
P1.29 Post It Note, 3" X 3", 12PK			
Unit Price	\$2.49	\$4.04	\$10.79
Item Total Price	\$996.00	\$1,616.00	\$4,316.00
Description	BSN 36612	BSN 36612	BSN 36612
Quantity	400	400	400
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # BSN36612		SSI#028622/3M/654

P1.30 CARD, INDEX, PLAIN, 3" X 5"			
Unit Price	\$0.46	\$0.80	\$0.39
Item Total Price	\$23.00	\$40.00	\$19.50
Description	BSN 65258	BSN 65258	BSN 65258
Quantity	50	50	50
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # BSN65258		SSI#088708/AMERICAN PAPER CONVERTERS INC/IND35P Bid and priced as pack of 100
P1.31 Envelope, Plain, Clasp, Brown, 12" X 12", 100/Box			
Unit Price	\$5.68	\$13.99	\$6.84
Item Total Price	\$1,022.40	\$2,518.20	\$1,231.20
Description	Envelope, Plain, Clasp, Brown, 12" X 12", 100/Box	Envelope, Plain, Clasp, Brown, 12" X 12", 100/Box	Envelope, Plain, Clasp, Brown, 12" X 12", 100/Box
Quantity	180	180	180
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # QUA37890	UNV35264	SSI# 085044/SCHOOL SMART/85044 Bid and priced as pack of 100
P1.32 Envelope, Plain, Clasp, Brown, 10" X 13", 100/Box			
Unit Price	\$6.78	\$16.98	\$8.30
Item Total Price	\$1,084.80	\$2,716.80	\$1,328.00
Description	Envelope, Plain, Clasp, Brown, 10" X 13", 100/Box	Envelope, Plain, Clasp, Brown, 10" X 13", 100/Box	Envelope, Plain, Clasp, Brown, 10" X 13", 100/Box
Quantity	160	160	160
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # QUA37897	UNV35267	SSI# 085046/SCHOOL SMART/85046 Bid and priced as pack of 100
P1.33 Envelope, 6.5" X 9.5"			
Unit Price	\$10.30	\$17.97	\$5.81
Item Total Price	\$515.00	\$898.50	\$290.50
Description	QUA 37863	QUA 37863	QUA 37863
Quantity	50	50	50
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # QUA37863		SSI#085040/QUALITY PARK PRODUCTS/85040 Bid and priced as pack of 100

P1.34 Book, Journal, 300 Page			
Unit Price	\$11.44	\$40.98	\$1.03
Item Total Price	\$743.60	\$2,663.70	\$66.95
Description	Book, Journal, 300 Page	Book, Journal, 300 Page	Book, Journal, 300 Page
Quantity	65	65	65
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # RED56131. If chosen FSI will bring item into stock allowing next day delivery.	BOR66300J	SSI# 086769/SCHOOL SMART/MMK37104SS-5987
P1.35 Book, Steno, Gregg, 60 SH,			
Unit Price	\$1.05	\$20.19	\$0.77
Item Total Price	\$100.80	\$1,938.24	\$73.92
Description	TOP 8001	TOP 8001	TOP 8001
Quantity	96	96	96
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # TOP8001. OEM is sold 12/PK - must order in PK quantity. Alternate item is RED36746 at \$.88/EA		SSI#085292/TOPS/12103
P1.36 Correction Tape, Dispenser, Mono White			
Unit Price	\$0.55	\$2.06	\$1.57
Item Total Price	\$550.00	\$2,060.00	\$1,570.00
Description	Correction Tape, Dispenser, Mono White	Correction Tape, Dispenser, Mono White	Correction Tape, Dispenser, Mono White
Quantity	1000	1000	1000
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # ITA60232	UNV75606	SSI# 079593/BIC/WOTAPP11

P1.37 Fluid, Correct			
Unit Price	\$0.99	\$2.00	\$0.93
Item Total Price	\$99.00	\$200.00	\$93.00
Description	PAP5660115	PAP5660115	PAP5660115
Quantity	100	100	100
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # BICWOFQDPBUF. BIC item is sold 2/PK - must purchase in PK quantity. If chosen FSI will bring BIC item into stock allowing next day delivery. Requested item PAP5660115 has been discontinued by the manufacturer. Wholesalers have minimal stock available.		SSI#026931/SANFORD LP/5640115
P1.38 Standard Staples			
Unit Price	\$0.46	\$0.79	\$0.51
Item Total Price	\$184.00	\$316.00	\$204.00
Description	Standard Staples	Standard Staples	Standard Staples
Quantity	400	400	400
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # BSN65649	UNV79000	SSI# 061059/SCHOOL SMART/SBS191-4 Bid and priced as pack of 5000
P1.39 Paper Clip, Giant Premium			
Unit Price	\$0.87	\$2.05	\$0.45
Item Total Price	\$511.56	\$1,205.40	\$264.60
Description	OIC99918	OIC99918	OIC99918
Quantity	588	588	588
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # OIC99918. Alternate item is OIC99914 at \$.40/BX		SSI#084475/OFFICEMATE INTL CORP/04914BX Bid and priced as pack of 100

P1.40 Shears, Bent, 8"			
Unit Price	\$3.91	\$7.69	\$3.00
Item Total Price	\$195.50	\$384.50	\$150.00
Description	ACM4321-8	ACM4321-8	ACM4321-8
Quantity	50	50	50
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # ACM43218. Alternate item is BSN65647 at \$.97/EA		SSI#1326605/FISKARS BRANDS INC/01-004250J
P1.41 Label, Laser,1 x 2 x 5/8			
Unit Price	\$12.45	\$28.29	\$24.50
Item Total Price	\$572.70	\$1,301.34	\$1,127.00
Description	AVE 5160	AVE 5160	AVE 5160
Quantity	46	46	46
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # AVE5160. Alternate item is AVE30600 at \$6.95/BX		SSI#067673/AVERY PRODUCTS CORP/5160 Bid and priced as pack of 3000
P1.42 Wipes, Purrell, 270 CT			
Unit Price	\$9.30	\$15.29	\$0.00
Item Total Price	\$130.20	\$214.06	\$0.00
Description	GOJ911306	GOJ911306	GOJ911306
Quantity	14	14	14
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # GOJ911306		NO BID
P1.43 Clorox Disinfecting Wipes, Fresh Scent, 75 Count Canister			
Unit Price	\$2.50	\$6.11	\$25.42
Item Total Price	\$150.00	\$366.60	\$1,525.20
Quantity	60	60	60
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # CLO15949EA		SSI#091446/RJ SCHINNER CO INC/CLO 15949 Bid and priced as cases of 6

P1.44 Sanitizer, Hand, Purrell			
Unit Price	\$3.27	\$4.50	\$3.62
Item Total Price	\$313.92	\$432.00	\$347.52
Description	GOJ965212	GOJ965212	GOJ965212
Quantity	96	96	96
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # GOJ965212EA. Alternate item is DIA01585 at \$2.88/EA	GOJ965212EA	SSI#025507/RJ SCHINNER CO INC/9652-12
P1.45 Clipboard, Standard, 9 X 15			
Unit Price	\$0.78	\$2.10	\$0.83
Item Total Price	\$15.60	\$42.00	\$16.60
Description	BSN 28554	BSN 28554	BSN 28554
Quantity	20	20	20
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	15 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # BSN28554		SSI#1272481/FAST POWER ENTERPRISE LTD/1272481
P1.46 Punch, 2 Hole, 4" x 2.75			
Unit Price	\$9.25	\$17.86	\$0.00
Item Total Price	\$111.00	\$214.32	\$0.00
Description	SWI74050	SWI74050	SWI74050
Quantity	12	12	12
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # SWI74050. Alternate item #1 is OIC90082 at \$7.55/EA. Alternate #2 is BSN65626 at \$4.75/EA		NO BID
P1.47 Calculator, Display, 10 DGT			
Unit Price	\$4.42	\$12.99	\$0.00
Item Total Price	\$212.16	\$623.52	\$0.00
Description	VCT 1100-3A	VCT 1100-3A	VCT 1100-3A
Quantity	48	48	48
Estimated Delivery	1 Days after award	1 Days after award	Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # VCT11003A		NO BID

P1.48 Surge Suppressors with 6 outlets			
Unit Price	\$4.62	\$11.69	\$13.34
Item Total Price	\$332.64	\$841.68	\$960.48
Description	CCS25102	CCS25102	CCS25102
Quantity	72	72	72
Estimated Delivery Date	8/5/2016	8/9/2016	8/17/2016
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # CCS25102		SSI#384561/ACCO BRANDS USA LLC- ACCO PRODUCTS/K62146NA
P1.49 Handset, Cordless Phone, 1 X 2 X 5/8			
Unit Price	\$20.66	\$32.99	\$0.00
Item Total Price	\$826.40	\$1,319.60	\$0.00
Description	VTE CS56619	VTE CS56619	VTE CS56619
Quantity	40	40	40
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	1 Days after award	Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI item # VTECS6619. If chosen FSI will bring item into stock allowing next day delivery.	VTECS66192	NO BID
Group P2: SCHEDULE B			
P2.1 GENERAL CATALOG: Percentage Discount			
Unit Price	63.00%	50.00%	0.00%
Item Total Price	63.00%	50.00%	0.00%
Description	Percentage (%) of discount for other items purchased from the current year(s) catalog and published price list.	Percentage (%) of discount for other items purchased from the current year(s) catalog and published price list.	Percentage (%) of discount for other items purchased from the current year(s) catalog and published price list.
Quantity	1	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	Days after award	Days after award
Comment (Optional)	FSI is offering a 63% discount off of the published list price catalog file for non exclusion items. Stock items are available next day, others may have a lead time up to 7 days.		39% Supplies (9/8)

P2.2 \$76,000.00 (Estimated Contract Value) Less ____% (Percentage from Item P2.1)			
Unit Price	28,120.00	38000	76,000.00
Item Total Price	28,120.00	38000	76,000.00
Description	\$76,000.00 (Estimated Contract Value) Less ____% (Percentage from Item P2.1) = \$ _____ (Key in this amount)	\$76,000.00 (Estimated Contract Value) Less ____% (Percentage from Item P2.1) = \$ _____ (Key in this amount)	\$76,000.00 (Estimated Contract Value) Less ____% (Percentage from Item P2.1) = \$ _____ (Key in this amount)
Quantity	1	1	1
Questions			
Page 1			
Group 1			
1.1 What is your estimated delivery time after receipt of order?	Next business day if ordered by 3:00 p.m.	1-2 business days	4-15 Business Days