COUNTY OF LEXINGTON

Procurement Services
212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503, 5th Floor

Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493
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“Phone (803) 785-8166
Fax (803) 785-2240

THIS IS A STATEMENT OF INTENT TO AWARD A CONTRACT AND BECOMES
THE OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF AWARD CONTINGENT UPON COUNTY COUNCIL
APPROVAL UNLESS OTHERWISE RESCINDED.

REFERENCE SOLICITATION NUMBER: B13025-11/19/12B
PROCUREMENT: EMS Rescue Equipment
ISSUE DATE: October 26, 2012
CLOSING DATE: November 19, 2012

AWARD(S) ARE MADE TO THE FOLLOWING:
MES, Inc.
$31,760.00

An actual bidder who is aggrieved in connection with the intended award or award of a contract
shall protest to the Procurement Manager in writing within ten (10) calendar days of the date of
Intent to Award notice. Protest letter shall state the issues of the protest, specifically listing
where the County failed in determining the potential award.

Jo az)ﬁfown, CPPB
Procurement Officer

Posted: November 27, 2012

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER.
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County of Lexington
Bid Tabulation
Bid # : B13025-11/19/12B

EMS Rescue Equipment

MES Newton's Fire & Safety Safe Industry
Item #| Qty | U/M |Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
1 1 | EA |Hurst Simo Unit 375710000 $5,285.00 $5,289.00 $4,855.00 $4,855.00 No Bid No Bid
Hurst KL-32 Spreader
2 1 | EA [362R522 $5,354.00 $5,354.00 $4,925.00 $4,925.00 No Bid No Bid
3 1 | EA |362R487 $3,736.00 $3,736.00 $3,450.00 $3,450.00 No Bid No Bid
4 1 | EA |Hurst MOC Combination Tool ]  $4,545.00 $4,545.00 $3,975.00 $3,975.00 No Bid No Bid
5 1 | EA [Hurst RAM T-41 257R154 $2,952.00 $2,992.00f $2,750.00 $2,750.00 No Bid No Bid
6 1 [ EA |Hurst RAM T-59 257R155 $3,138.00 $3,138.00 $2,895.00 $2,895.00 No Bid No Bid
Hannay Electric Rewind Hose
7 4 | EA |Reels $920.00 $3,680.00 $1,995.00 $7,980.00 No Bid No Bid
8 2 | EA |30° Hydraulic Hose Orange $465.00 $930.00 $435.00 $870.00 No Bid No Bid
Gallons of Hurst Blue
9 4 | EA [Hydraulic Fluid $71.00 $284.00 $65.00 $260.00 No Bid No Bid
10 4 | EA |Streamline Female Ends $151.00 $604.00 $190.00 $760.00 No Bid No Bid
11 8 | EA [Streamline Male Ends $151.00 $1,208.00 $170.00 $1,360.00 No Bid No Bid
Total $31,760.00 $34,080.00 $0.00

Bid Opened : November 19, 2012 @ 3:00 PM

Jo Marie Brown, CPPB
Procurement Officer




