

# COUNTY OF LEXINGTON

Procurement Services  
212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503, 5th Floor  
Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493



Phone (803) 785-8319  
Fax (803) 785-2240

THIS IS A STATEMENT OF **INTENT TO AWARD** A CONTRACT AND BECOMES THE OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF AWARD CONTINGENT UPON COUNTY COUNCIL APPROVAL UNLESS OTHERWISE RESCINDED.

REFERENCE SOLICITATION NUMBER: B13042-04/18/13K  
PROCUREMENT: HEARTSTART MRX ALS MONITORS  
ISSUE DATE: MARCH 28, 2013  
CLOSING DATE: APRIL 18, 2013

AWARD(S) ARE MADE TO THE FOLLOWING:

***Bound Tree Medical, LLC***  
***\$70,543.38***

An actual bidder who is aggrieved in connection with the intended award or award of a contract shall protest to the Procurement Manager in writing within ten (10) calendar days of the date of Intent to Award notice. Protest letter shall state the issues of the protest, specifically listing where the County failed in determining the potential award.

Kay Keisler  
Procurement Officer

Posted: April 22, 2013

**THIS IS NOT AN ORDER**

**DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER.**

**County of Lexington**

**Bid Tabulation**

**BID #: B13042-04/18/13K**

**HEARTSTART MRX ALS MONITORS**

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	BOUND TREE MEDICAL, LLC		SOUTHEASTERN EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT		ZOLL MEDICAL CORPORATION	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	3	EA	HeartStart MRX ALS Monitors	\$ 20,749.13	\$ 62,247.39	\$ 21,389.33	\$ 64,167.99	* NO BID	* NO BID
			Taxes		\$ 4,357.32		\$ 4,491.76		
			<b>Sub Total</b>		\$ 66,604.71		\$ 68,659.75		

OPTION									
1	3	EA	BT Upgrade	\$ 1,227.00	\$ 3,681.00	\$ 1,300.00	\$ 3,900.00	* NO BID	* NO BID
			Taxes		\$ 257.67		\$ 273.00		
			<b>Sub Total</b>		\$ 3,938.67		\$ 4,173.00		
			<b>GRAND TOTAL (Base Bid plus Option)</b>		\$ 70,543.38		\$ 72,832.75	* NO BID	* NO BID

\* Zoll Medical Corporation submitted a "NO BID" due to the no substitution requirement in the bid.

Bids Received: April 18, 2013 @ 3:00 PM

Kay Keisler  
Procurement Officer