

# COUNTY OF LEXINGTON

Procurement Services  
212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503, 5th Floor  
Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493



Phone (803) 785-8319  
Fax (803) 785-2240

THIS IS A STATEMENT OF **INTENT TO AWARD** A CONTRACT AND BECOMES THE OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF AWARD CONTINGENT UPON COUNTY COUNCIL APPROVAL UNLESS OTHERWISE RESCINDED.

REFERENCE SOLICITATION NUMBER: ***B14040-04/29/14S***

PROCUREMENT: ***WEAPONS PURCHASE ACCESSORIES AND DISPOSAL OF USED AND CONFISCATED FIREARMS***

ISSUE DATE: ***April 8, 2014***

CLOSING DATE: ***April 29, 2014***

AWARD(S) ARE MADE TO THE FOLLOWING:

***Lot #1: No Award***

***Lot #2 - #3 Lawmen's Safety Supply, Inc.***

***Lot #4 Phoenix Distributors, Inc.***

An actual bidder who is aggrieved in connection with the intended award or award of a contract shall protest to the Procurement Manager in writing within ten (10) calendar days of the date of Intent to Award notice. Protest letter shall state the issues of the protest, specifically listing where the County failed in determining the potential award.

Angela M. Seymour  
Procurement Officer

Posted: ***April 30, 2014***

**THIS IS NOT AN ORDER**

**DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER.**

County of Lexington

Bid Tabulation

BID: B14040-04/29/14S

Weapons Accessories Purchase and Disposal of Used and Confiscated Firearms

				Clyde Armory, Inc.		Lawmen's Safety and Supply, Inc.		Phoenix Distributors,	
Lot #1	Qty	U/M	Description	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
1	1	ea	Advanced Training Systems PTX200 Wireless Handheld Programmable controller	\$ 1,640.00	\$ 1,640.00	\$ 1,390.00	\$ 1,390.00		No Bid
2	2	ea	Safariland 7360-832-412	\$ 71.00	\$ 142.00	\$ 63.77	\$ 127.54		No Bid
3	8	ea	Safariland 7360-832-411	\$ 60.23	\$ 481.84	\$ 63.77	\$ 510.16		No Bid
4	3	ea	Safariland 6360-832-412	\$ 126.55	\$ 379.65	\$ 78.78	\$ 236.34		No Bid
5	1	ea	Safariland 6360-832-411	\$ 126.55	\$ 14,932.90	\$ 78.78	\$ 78.78		No Bid
6	1	Lot	Total Trade In Offer on Confiscated Firearms	\$ 17,576.40	\$ 17,576.40	\$ 27,380.00	\$ 27,380.00		No Bid
<b>Lot #2</b>									
1	4	ea	Safariland 7360-832-412	\$ 71.00	\$ 284.00	\$ 63.77	\$ 255.08		No Bid
2	15	ea	Safariland 7360-832-411	\$ 71.00	\$ 1,065.00	\$ 63.77	\$ 956.55		No Bid
3	5	ea	Safariland 6360-832-412	\$ 379.66	\$ 1,898.30	\$ 78.78	\$ 393.90		No Bid
4	25	ea	Safariland 6360-832-411	\$ 126.55	\$ 3,163.75	\$ 78.78	\$ 1,969.50		No Bid
			<b>Subtotal</b>		<b>\$ 6,411.05</b>		<b>\$ 3,575.03</b>		<b>No Bid</b>
			<b>Tax</b>		<b>\$ 448.77</b>		<b>\$ 250.25</b>		<b>No Bid</b>
			<b>Total</b>		<b>\$ 6,859.82</b>		<b>\$ 3,825.28</b>		<b>No Bid</b>
<b>Lot #3</b>									
1	1	ea	Advanced Training Systems PTX200 Wireless Handheld Programmable controller	\$ 1,640.00	\$ 1,640.00	\$ 1,390.00	\$ 1,390.00		No Bid
			<b>Tax</b>		<b>\$ 114.80</b>		<b>\$ 97.30</b>		<b>No Bid</b>
			<b>Total</b>		<b>\$ 1,754.80</b>		<b>\$ 1,487.30</b>		<b>No Bid</b>
<b>Lot #4</b>									
1	1	Lot	Offer to Purchase Used Service and Confiscated Firearms	\$ 17,605.00	<b>\$ 17,605.00</b>	\$ 27,380.00	<b>\$ 27,380.00</b>	<b>\$ 30,315.00</b>	<b>\$ 30,315.00</b>

Lot #1			King Firearms		Columbia Arms		Walker Hardware, LLC.		
Item	Qty	U/M	Description	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
1	1	ea	Advanced Training Systems PTX200 Wireless Handheld Programmable controller		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
2	2	ea	Safariland 7360-832-412		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
3	8	ea	Safariland 7360-832-411		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
4	3	ea	Safariland 6360-832-412		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
5	1	ea	Safariland 6360-832-411		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
6	1	Lot	Total Trade In Offer on Confiscated Firearms		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid

**Lot #2**

1	4	ea	Safariland 7360-832-412		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
2	15	ea	Safariland 7360-832-411		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
3	5	ea	Safariland 6360-832-412		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
4	25	ea	Safariland 6360-832-411		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
			<b>Subtotal</b>		<b>No Bid</b>		<b>No Bid</b>		<b>No Bid</b>
			<b>Tax</b>		<b>No Bid</b>		<b>No Bid</b>		<b>No Bid</b>
			<b>Total</b>		<b>No Bid</b>		<b>No Bid</b>		<b>No Bid</b>

**Lot #3**

1	1	ea	Advanced Training Systems PTX200 Wireless Handheld Programmable controller		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
			<b>Tax</b>		<b>No Bid</b>		<b>No Bid</b>		<b>No Bid</b>
			<b>Total</b>		<b>No Bid</b>		<b>No Bid</b>		<b>No Bid</b>

**Lot #4**

1	1	Lot	Offer to Purchase Used Service and Confiscated Firearms	\$ 21,699.00	<b>\$ 21,699.00</b>	\$ 11,500.00	<b>\$ 11,500.00</b>	\$ 9,039.00	<b>\$ 9,039.00</b>
---	---	-----	---	--------------	---------------------	--------------	---------------------	-------------	--------------------

**\*\*Craig's Firearm Supply, Inc. submitted a "no bid" response due to they are not able to bid Safariland products in South Carolina.**

Bids opened April 29, 2014 @ 3:00 PM E.S.T.

Angela M. Seymour  
Procurement Officer